Tax Invoice

Sold By: Sane Retails Private Limited ,

Ship-from Address: Warehouse Building Nos. WE-I1, Renaissance Integratedindustrial Area, Village Vashere, Bhiwandi , Thane, Mumbai ,

Maharashtra -421302, Bhiwandi, MAHARASHTRA, India - 421302, IN-MH
GSTIN - 27AAXCS0974R1Z3

Invoice Number # FAFO7X2100063050

Order ID: 0D221215234063813000 ;|| To

Ship To
Order Date: 09-03-2021 Vikas Kumar Vikas Kumar
Flat No. B1106, Arihant Anaya, Flat No. B1106, Arihant Anaya, *Keep this invoice and
Invoice Date: 10-03-2021 Sector 35G, Kharghar. Sector 35G, Kharghar. manufacturer box for
PAN: aaxcs0974r Navi Mumbai 410210 Maharashtra Navi Mumbai 410210 Maharashtra warranty purposes.

Phone: XxxxxXxxxxx
CIN: U52500HR2016PTC064234

Phone: XXxxxxxxxx

Total items: 1
Product Title Qty  Gross Discount Taxable CGSTX SGST Total ¥
Amount ¥ Z Value ¥ JUTGST
4
Handsets SAMSUNG Galaxy F62 1 23999.00 -9671.00 12142.38 1092.81 1092.81 14328.00
FSN: (Laser Grey, 128 GB)

MOBFZWSUZGKGHMHD  Warranty: 1 Year Warranty Provided by the
HSN/SAC: 85171211 Manufacturer from Date of Purchase
1. [IMEl/Serial No: 350641032461953]
CGST:9.0%
SGST/UTGST: 9.0 %

Total 1

23999.00 -9671.00 12142.38 1092.81 1092.81 14328.00

Grand Total ¥14328.00

Sane Retails Private Limited

Authorized Signatory

Flipkart g
Thank You!

for shopping with us

Returns Policy: At Flipkart wetry to deliver perfectly each and every time. But in the off-chance that you need to return the item, please do so with the original Brand box/price

tag, original packing and invoice without which it will be really difficult for usto act on your request. Please help usin helping you. Terms and conditions apply.

The goods sold as are intended for end user consumption and not for re-sale.

Regd. office: Sane Retails Private Limited , First Floor, SC.O 219 Sector-14, PANCHKULA, HARYANA - 134113

Contact Flipkart: 1800 208 9898 || www.flipkart.com/helpcentre

E.&0.E. |page10f1



3/31/2021 FW: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

From: Gautam Karkal

Sent: 30 March 2021 17:15:09

To: Priyanka Kumari

Cc: Vikas Kumar; Abdulkhalid Sheikh

Subject: Re: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

Ok approved

Sent from my iPhone

On 30-Mar-2021, at 10:48, Priyanka Kumari <Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com> wrote:

Hi,
Since Gautam is on leave and not well, it is pending.
Once he will approve the same, will process.

Regards,
Priyanka

From: Vikas Kumar

Sent: Friday, March 26, 2021 2:15 PM

To: Priyanka Kumari <Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com>

Cc: Abdulkhalid Sheikh <Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.com>
Subject: RE: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

Dear Priyanka,
Waiting for approval. Please arrange on priority.

Regards,
Vikas Kumar

From: Priyanka Kumari

Sent: 22 March 2021 10:03:42

To: Gautam Karkal

Cc: Vikas Kumar; Abdulkhalid Sheikh; Sriman Narain

Subject: RE: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

Please give OK

From: Sriman Narain

Sent: Sunday, March 21, 2021 10:23 AM

To: Abdulkhalid Sheikh <Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.com>

Cc: Priyanka Kumari <Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com>; Vikas Kumar <Vikas.Kumar@racold.com>
Subject: Re: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

Approved
Sriman

Sent from my iPhone

https://mailaccess.aristonthermo.com/owa/?ae=PreFormAction&a=Forward&t=IPM.Note&id=RgAAAABM5Vs9jM7pRJIXcVBi1zznpBwDvxMLCIpS...
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3/31/2021

https://mailaccess.aristonthermo.com/owa/?ae=PreFormAction&a=Forward&t=IPM.Note&id=RgAAAABM5Vs9jM7pRJIXcVBi1zznpBwDvxMLCIpS...

FW: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

On 20-Mar-2021, at 11:14 AM, Abdulkhalid Sheikh
<Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Kindly approve for purchase of Mobile Handset to ASM ,Mr.Vikas as per our company
policy.

Regards,

Abdulkhalid Sheikh,

General Manager —Sales.
Ariston Thermo India Pvt Ltd.
MUMBAI.
Mobile-8879764447

From: Vikas Kumar

Sent: Friday, March 12, 2021 9:35 PM

To: Abdulkhalid Sheikh <Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.com>
Subject: Approval request for Purchase of Mobile Handset

Dear Sir,

I am using my personal handset for official purpose, However it has started giving

trouble while using and I need to purchase a new handset.

I request you provide necessary approval for purchase of New Mobile Handset as

per Organisation's H R Policy.

Thanks & Regards,
Vikas Kumar

Sent from my Galaxy
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