
 

 
 
From: Priyanka Kumari  
Sent: 23 July 2021 17:16 
To: Poonam Sharma <Corporate.IndiaHR@aristonthermo.com> 
Subject: RE: Please claim 
 
You can claim on this basis 
 
 
From: Poonam Sharma <Corporate.IndiaHR@aristonthermo.com>  
Sent: Friday, July 23, 2021 4:59 PM 
To: Priyanka Kumari <Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com> 
Subject: RE: Please claim 
 
We need invoice na to claim? 
 
If u have , can you please share with me 
 
From: Priyanka Kumari  
Sent: 23 July 2021 16:57 
To: Poonam Sharma <Corporate.IndiaHR@aristonthermo.com> 
Subject: Please claim 
 
 


