
From: "Priyanka Kumari"
To: "Gobinda Gudu" <Gobinda.Gudu@aristonthermo.com>

Date: 9/14/2021 6:17:19 AM
Subject: RE: Request to approve vaccination fee

OK
 
Please claim in the portal
 
From: Gobinda Gudu <Gobinda.Gudu@aristonthermo.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, September 14, 2021 4:43 PM
To: Priyanka Kumari <Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com>
Cc: Aazad Singh <Aazad.Singh@aristonthermo.com>; Sutanu Dey <MIS.EAST@aristonthermo.com>
Subject: Request to approve vaccination fee
 
Dear Madam,
 
Gayatri Sahoo (spouse) & I have fully vaccinated .
1st Dose Rs.900 each and 2nd Dose Rs. 780 each . All payment slip attached herewith .
 
Please approve same .
 
Regards,
Gobinda
7718880406

Page 1

9/14/2021

mailto:
mailto:Gobinda.Gudu@aristonthermo.com

