amazon.in

Sold By :

SAVEX TECHNOLOGIES PRIVATE LIMITED

" Building No. 5, BGR Warehousing Complex,
Near Shiv Sagar Hotel, Village Vahuli, Bhiwandi,
Thane

BHIWANDI, MAHARASHTRA, 421302

IN

PAN No: AAACS5547H
GST Registration No: 27AAACS5547H128

Order Number: 408-6835931-8205954
Order Date: 06.08.2021

Tax Invoice/Bill of Supply/Cash Memo
(Original for Recipient)

Billing Address :

Kiran R. Bansod

B 605, PINNACLE BLD, GREEN HILL CHS.,
NEAR SHANI MANDIR, GODREJ HILL ROAD,
KALYAN, MAHARASHTRA, 421301

IN

State/UT Code: 27

Shipping Address :

Kiran R. Bansod

Kiran R. Bansod

B 605, PINNACLE BLD, GREEN HILL CHS.,
NEAR SHANI MANDIR, GODREJ HILL ROAD,
KALYAN, MAHARASHTRA, 421301

IN

State/UT Code: 27

Place of supply: MAHARASHTRA

Place of delivery: MAHARASHTRA

Invoice Number : BOM7-61630
Invoice Details : MH-BOM7-170950221-2122
Invoice Date : 06.08.2021

Sl Net Tax |Tax |Tax Total
i
No Descrpue Unit Pﬂmm’»\moum Rate Type |Amount |Amount
1 [Samsung Galaxy M31 (Ocean Blue, 6GB RAM, 128GB
Storage) | BOTHGGYWL6 ( STPL M31 6/128 Blue ) 12,711.02| 1 [12,711.02| 9% |CGST| 11,143.99 | 114,999.00
HSN:85171211
9% [SGST| 1,143.99
TOTAL: 12,287.98114.999.00

Amount in Words:

Fourteen Thousand Nine Hundred Ninety-nine only

For SAVEX TECHNOLOGIES PRIVATE LIMITED:

(f‘r—:’?’

Authorized Signatory

Whether tax is payable under reverse charge - No

Please note that this inve

azon Seller Services Pyt Lid.. ARIPL-Amazon Retail India Pvt Ltd {only where
esious of avaling wnput GST credr are requested 1o create a Business

Ice

1 Amazon Retal India Py Lid fulfiliment center is co-located

ccount and purchase on Amazon.inbusiness trom Business gl Qible offers

* 15 not a demand for payment



From: Sriman Narain
<Sriman.Narain@aristonthermo.com>
Date: 17-Aug-2021 11:02 am

Subject: Re: Request for mobile handset
approval.

To: Abdulkhalid Sheikh

<Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.com
>

Cc: Priyanka Kumari

<Priyanka.Kumari@aristonthermo.com>,
Gautam Karkal

<Gautam.Karkal@aristonthermo.com>

Approved

Sriman

Sent from my iPhone

On 17-Aug-2021, at 10:55 AM,
Abdulkhalid Sheikh
<Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@aristonthermo.co
m> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Our ASM Mr.Kiran wants to buy mobile
handset as per company policy.

Kindly approve.



Gautam Karkal 2:16 pm “
to Kiran, Priyanka, Abdulkhalid, Sri... v

Approved as per policy

From: Kiran Bansod

Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 4:22 PM

To: Priyanka Kumari

Cc: Priyanka Kumari; Gautam Karkal; Abdulkhalid Sheikh;
Sriman Narain

Subject: RE: Reminder Request for mobile handset approval.

Dear Madam,
Kindly response.
I have got approval from Sriman Sir. I need to

submit my mobile bill in the portal. Kindly
suggest.

Thanks,
Kiran

Hide quoted text

On 21 Oct 2021 2:57 pm, Kiran Bansod
<Kiran.Bansod@ariston.com> wrote:
Dear Madam,

Kindly find the request mail. Waiting for
your valuable reply.

Ihank&



