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Viju Nair

From: Ninad Shelar
Sent: 10 November 2022 11:47
To: Viju Nair
Cc: Hrushikesh Joshi
Subject: RE: Renewal of Ariston India LEI

Approved 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Ninad Shelar 
VP - Finance 
Ariston Thermo India Private Limited 
9th Floor, The Executive Centre, World Trade Centre, Kharadi, Pune, Maharashtra - 411014. INDIA 
Mobile: +91-9920611301 
Email : ninad.shelar@aristonthermo.com 

   
www.racold.com I www.aristonthermo.com/en/Brand/racold 
 

From: Viju Nair  
Sent: 10 November 2022 11:43 
To: Ninad Shelar <Ninad.Shelar@ariston.com> 
Cc: Hrushikesh Joshi <Hrushikesh.Joshi@ariston.com> 
Subject: Renewal of Ariston India LEI 
 
Dear Ninad, 
 
The LEI we have taken for Ariston India is valid till 12th Nov 22. 
Request your approval to renew it for next one year. 
The fee for renewal is around Rs 5000 plus GST. I will pay the amount directly from my credit card and reimburse it. 
 
Request your approval. 
 
Regards 
Viju Nair 
 


