Dinesh Mahajan

From: Shriniwas Joshi

Sent: 22 March 2023 11:15

To: Dinesh Mahajan

Cc: Vishal Astunkar; Mukund Bandre

Subject: RE: Laptop flickering issue and cd panel need to be change estimate

Ok if it is ok to Mukund.

From: Dinesh Mahajan <Dinesh.Mahajan@ariston.com>

Sent: 21 March 2023 15:45

To: Shriniwas Joshi <Shriniwas.Joshi@ariston.com>

Cc: Vishal Astunkar <Vishal.Astunkar@ariston.com>; Mukund Bandre <Mukund.Bandre@ariston.com>
Subject: Laptop flickering issue and cd panel need to be change estimate

Dear sir

PFA. Visited today for laptop repair at local vendor given 5300/- estimate and authorised Lenovo service center given
verbal 15000/- estimate as per discussion with Mukund sir preferred for local vendor because laptop is in outwarranty
.So kindly approve 5300/-amount for laptop repair.

Regard
Dinesh Mahajan
8108663155



