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"SMARTHA/th
Reliance Retail Linited
REL TANCE SHART BAZAAR
Netivali Uilla —
|
" td Netivali Uillage Kalyan
Metro Junction (/0 Hard Castle § Uaud
THANE Maharashtra 421301 -
(ustoner care: 16008910001 / 1800102
(1N No : HGIIOGHHI@GGPLLI?G&&J

GSTIN- 2]AABCRI11BE1ZP
FSSAT Lic No 1152102!000383

Vnu hﬂUB &ﬂUBd Rs 3235 7?

I INOICE

sskessarsasnnas Original For Recipiant sssssssssssxsisd

Place of Supply b State Code: 27 MH

Custamer Type: URD -
Date:06/11/2024 17:13:33 Bill No:63
store: FHI4 Cashier :60861744 Pas No:R134

1) CGST @ 6.00% SGST @ 6.003

08135020 419.60 4 1676.40
GL UTSAVA DRYFRT GFTPCK ASRT 5006 CBD

08135020 530.63 1 530.83
UL FDS PRH TST THE TRAD DF BFTPK 5009BAG

ltels 2 0ty:5 2209.23
Tota) Amount Paid 2209.23
PINELAB x-2100-007757— "\ 2209.23

{p,,uaum" IHCLUSIUE\IJF APPLICABLE TAXES)

-----------------------------------------------

_______________________________________________________

Total 1972.53 113 35 o |1ﬂ 35 0.00 2209.23
Faynentﬂefﬂut Fi 4134005306112024
TaxInuoiced FR 41@42454?438
Rone Card MNo.: 9&7!32X558*Rﬂne Emﬂ(nnuunt] :81.35
Terns\} Cund1t1uﬁs ﬂn lv

(I llﬂllllllllll!l

* (hank You for Shopping with us ¥
Website: wwu.reliancerstail.con
Custoner Care email - customerservice@ril.com
Please refer to aur Waebsite link
https://relianceretail.con/privacy-policy.html

fur Privacy Policy

"Dynamic Quick Response (QR) code is made

avallable tu the Recipient through a digital display”
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Kiran Baban Mhaske

From: Abdulkhalid Sheikh

Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 6:03 PM

To: Kiran Baban Mhaske; Sriman Narain

Subject: Re: Approval for Diwali gift expense - for project clients
Approved

Regards,

Abdulkhalid sheikh
Regional Manager -Sales
Gujarat,MP and Mumbai.
Ariston Group India Pvt Ltd
Mob-8879764447

From: Kiran Baban Mhaske <Kiran.BabanMhaske@ariston.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 4:59:01 PM

To: Sriman Narain <Sriman.Narain@ariston.com>; Abdulkhalid Sheikh <Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@ariston.com>
Subject: Approval for Diwali gift expense - for project clients

Dear sir,

Please approve the expense done for Diwali gift purchase for distribution to project clients

As per attached invoices please approve 2809/-Rs..

Thanks & Regards
Kiran Mhaske
Assistant Manager - Commercial Sales

Ariston Group India Private Limited
Part of Ariston Group

Ariston Group India Private Limited, C/0 Smartworks coworking spaces pvt.ltd, 2»d floor ,Fleet house
Marol Naka metro station, Andheri kurla road ,Andheri (East) - 400059.

M: +91 9870286558

ariston.com

www.racold.com



Kiran Baban Mhaske

From: Sriman Narain

Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 5:42 PM

To: Kiran Baban Mhaske; Abdulkhalid Sheikh

Subject: RE: Approval for Diwali gift expense - for project clients
Approved

Sriman

From: Kiran Baban Mhaske <Kiran.BabanMhaske@ariston.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 24, 2024 4:59 PM

To: Sriman Narain <Sriman.Narain@ariston.com>; Abdulkhalid Sheikh <Abdulkhalid.Sheikh@ariston.com>
Subject: Approval for Diwali gift expense - for project clients

Dear sir,

Please approve the expense done for Diwali gift purchase for distribution to project clients

As per attached invoices please approve 2809/-Rs..

Thanks & Regards
Kiran Mhaske
Assistant Manager - Commercial Sales

Ariston Group India Private Limited
Part of Ariston Group

Ariston Group India Private Limited, C/0 Smartworks coworking spaces pvt.ltd, 2 floor ,Fleet house
Marol Naka metro station, Andheri kurla road ,Andheri (East) - 400059.

M: +91 9870286558

ariston.com

www.racold.com



