Saibal Banerjee

From: Sriman Narain

Sent: 29 December 2020 14:39

To: Saibal Banerjee

Cc: Hrushikesh Joshi

Subject: Re: Please approve Food Bill with Azad and Team East today.
Approved.

Sriman

Sent from my iPhone

On 28-Dec-2020, at 5:25 PM, Saibal Banerjee <Saibal.Banerjee@aristonthermo.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Today we had Lunch together with Azad and Team East. | have paid the bill of 1836.00 and the same is attached here.
Kindly approve this bill and oblige.

Thanking you !

Warm Regards,

Saibal Banerjee
<Food Bill with Team & Azad Singh.pdf>



