Ticket HYB - MAS

Electronic Reservation Slip (ERS)-normal user
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Amrit Mahotsav S w
IR 23 N IRCTC
Booked from Boarding At To
HYDERABAD DECAN (HYB) HYDERABAD DECAN (HYB) MGR CHENNAI CTL (MAS)
Start Date* 06-Apr-2024 Departure* 16:45 06-Apr-2024 Arrival* 05:40 07-Apr-2024
PNR Train No./Name Class
4462761082 12604/CHENNAI SF EXP THIRD AC (3A)
Quota Distance Booking Date
GENERAL (GN) 715 KM 22-Feb-2024 15:35:43 HRS
Passenger Details
# Name Age Gender Booking Status Current Status
1. SANTHOSH KUMAR 51 M CNF/B2/27/UPPER CNF/B2/27/UPPER
2. KUMAR 47 M CNF/B2/30/UPPER CNF/B2/30/UPPER
3. KARTHIKYAN 38 M CNF/B2/29/MIDDLE CNF/B2/29/MIDDLE
4. SHANMUGASUNDARAA 43 M CNF/B2/38/UPPER CNF/B2/38/UPPER
Acronmyms: RLWL: REMOTE LOCATION WAITLIST POWL: POOLED QUOTA WAITLIST RSWL- ROAD-SIDE WATUST

Transaction ID: 100004807125122
IR recovers only 57% of cost of travel on an average.

Payment Details

Ticket Fare T 4,400.00
IRCTC Convenience Fee (Incl. of G5T) ¥ 35.40
Travel Insurance Premium (Incl. of GST) ¥ 180

Total Fare (all inclusive) T 4,437.20




Cancellation Mail :

M G ma |I santhosh kumar <santhoshvinitha007@gmail.com>
Cancellation

2 messages

santhosh kumar <santhoshvinitha007@gmail.com> Fri, Apr 5, 2024 at 10:16 AM

To: etickets@ircte.co.in
Sir,
| have booked ticket through my IRCTC Login In SANTHOSH73. Ticket Details Given below
Date of Journey : 06/04/2024
Train No. 12604 - CHENNAI SF Express
PNR - 4462761082
Class - 3A

Mo. of Passengers - 4 person

Now my Login ID SANTHOSH73 is blocked and not able to Login. Now i need to cancel the full ticket ( All the
passengers).

Request you kindly cancel the passenger from the ticket and arrange of refund

Santhosh
9884159859

Etickets <etickets@irctc.co.in> Fri, Apr 5, 2024 at 10:17 AM
To: santhosh kumar <santhoshvinitha007@gmail.com=>

Dear Customer,
4462761082

Already canceled



Cancellation Charges:

Cancellation

MAS - HYD - 04/04/24 Cost Refund | charges

Surya 1107.53 0

Santhosh 1107.53 0

Kumar 1107.53 | 820.36 287.17

Shanmugam 1107.53 | 545.36 562.17

Karthikeyan 1107.53 0
5537.65 | 1365.72 849.34

Cancellation

HYD - MAS 06/04/2024 | Cost Refund | charges

Santhosh 1109.3 910.36 198.94

Kumar 1109.3 910.36 198.94

Shanmugam 1109.3 910.36 198.94

Karthikeyan 1109.3 910.36 198.94
4437.2 | 3641.44 795.76

Total 9974.85 | 5007.16 1645.1

RSM - Approval

- RE: Ticket Cancellation Charges Approval - Message (HTML)
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Wed 5/8/2024 10:40 AM
VR Venkateshwar Rao
RE: Ticket Cancellation Charges Approval
fo Surya Prakash

“c Santhosh Kumar P; (U Satish Pawaskar

Approved

Venkat

From: Surya Prakash <Surya.MPrakash@ariston.com>

Sent: 07 May 2024 21:56

To: Venkateshwar Rao <Venkateshwar.Rao@ariston.com>

Cc: Santhosh Kumar P <santhoshkumar.p@ariston.com>; Satish Pawaskar <Satish.Pawaskar@ariston.com>
Subject: FW: Ticket Cancellation Charges Approval

Dear Sir,
Kindly approve below expenses ( Train Cancellation Charges — booked by Santosh for TN Team to Hyderabad Heat Pump Meeting dated on 05.05.24).

Thanks & Regards,
Surya.



From: Santhosh Kumar P <santhoshkumar.p@ariston.com>
Sent: 07 May 2024 20:56

To: Surya Prakash <Surya.MPrakash@ariston.com>
Subject: Ticket Cancellation Charges Approval

Dear Surya

Request you to approve Rs. 1645.10 towards ticket Cancellation charges for the incurred for our Hyderabad Trip

MAS - HYD - 04/04/24 Cost Refund Cancellation charges
Kumar 1107.53 820.36 287.17
Shanmugam 1107.53 545.36 562.17
5537.65 1365.72 849.34
HYD - MAS 06/04/2024 Cost Refund Cancellation charges
Santhosh 1109.3 910.36 198.94
Kumar 1109.3 910.36 198.94
Shanmugam 1109.3 910.36 198.94
Karthikeyan 1109.3 910.36 198.94
4437.2 3641.44 795.76
Total 9974.85 5007.16 1645.1
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